

**Monroe County Road Commission
2016 Asphalt Emulsions - Bid Tabulation**

Bid Opening: March 24, 2016 at 10:00 a.m.

Material Description		Asphalt Materials 940 N. Wynn Road Oregon, OH 43616 (419) 693-0626		K-Tech Specialty Coatings 111 West Garfield Ashley, IN 46705 (260) 587-3888		Michigan Paving & Materials 3125 East Front Street Monroe, MI 48161 (734) 240-3065	
		Unit	F.O.B. Origin	Delivered	F.O.B. Origin	Delivered	F.O.B. Origin
Asphalt Emulsions - MDOT Specifications							
RS-2a	Gal	\$1.30	\$1.3576	\$1.30	\$1.37	No Bid	No Bid
HFRS-2	Gal	\$1.30	\$1.3576	\$1.30	\$1.37	\$1.29	\$1.33
HFRS-2M	Gal	\$1.60	\$1.6576	\$1.38	\$1.45	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2	Gal	\$1.50	\$1.5576	\$1.45	\$1.52	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2M	Gal	\$1.60	\$1.6576	\$1.55	\$1.62	No Bid	No Bid
MS-Op	Gal	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.08	\$2.15	No Bid	No Bid
SS-1h	Gal	\$1.80	\$1.8576	\$1.38	\$1.45	No Bid	No Bid
CSS-1hd (diluted 50%)	Gal	\$1.30	\$1.3576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Other Asphalt Emulsions							
APME	Gal	\$1.60	\$1.6576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
AMS Seal SP	Gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.05	No Bid
AEP-B	Gal	\$1.70	\$1.7576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RS-2M	Gal	\$1.60	\$1.6576	\$1.38	\$1.45	No Bid	No Bid
MWS-150	Gal	\$1.75	\$1.8076	\$1.32	\$1.39	No Bid	No Bid
MWS-300	Gal	\$1.85	\$1.9076	\$1.48	\$1.55	No Bid	No Bid
Multigrade Asphalts							
CM-90	Gal	\$2.40	\$2.4576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CM-150	Gal	\$2.50	\$2.5576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CM-300	Gal	\$2.80	\$2.8576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Alternate Asphalt Materials (Describe)							
BM-90	Gal			\$2.18	\$2.25		
Chip Lock	Gal			\$1.10	\$1.17		
Asphalt Totes							
Asphalt Emulsion Delivered in Tote, 1 to 3 Totes	Gal	N/A	\$2.40	N/A	No Bid	N/A	\$2.35
Asphalt Emulsion Delivered in Tote, 3 to 7 Totes	Gal	N/A	\$2.40	N/A	No Bid	N/A	\$2.35
Asphalt Emulsion Delivered in Tote, 8 or More Totes	Gal	N/A	\$2.40	N/A	No Bid	N/A	\$2.35
Pugmill Rental							
Pugmill Rental	Ton	\$2.00		No Bid		No Bid	
Pugmill Mobilization	Ea	\$500.00		No Bid		No Bid	

Additional Remarks:

Asphalt Materials: Minimum Load = 5,400 Gallons, Two Hours Free Unload (\$90 per Hour After), Return Freight = 1 1/2 Times Rate

Michigan Paving & Materials: 2 Hours Free Unload < 9,000 Gallons (\$90 per Hour After), 3 Hours Free Unload > 9,000 Gallons (\$90 per Hour After), Additional charges for multiple stops will be \$85 for second stop and \$3.50 per mile thereafter, Return freight will be billed 1 1/2 times the outgoing rate or a minimum of \$200.00, Cancellations will be charged at \$350.00 if not requested 6.0 hours before delivery due time, Less than minimum loads may or may not incur additional freight charges